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From: Anna West
Sent: Tuesday, August 01, 2017 2:56 PM
To: 'Esther Kacmar'; 'reresearchgroup@ebiconsulting.com’
Subject: RE: GRAMA Record Request dated 6/27/2017
Importance: High

Ms. Kacmar — Michael Monis:

| am still waiting for a reply to my last email below. | am holding alil of your record copies and would like to finalize this
request.

Please respond back to me letting me know how you want to proceed with paying for and receiving the record copies pulled
per your GRAMA Request.

Thank you,

Anna West

From: Anna West

Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2017 9:18 AM

To: 'Esther Kacmar' <ekacmar@ebiconsulting.com>; 'reresearchgroup@ebiconsulting.com’
<reresearchgroup@ebiconsulting.com>

Subject: RE: GRAMA Record Request dated 6/27/2017

Importance: High

Ms. Kacmar,
The records were pulled as per the Original GRAMA Request. We simply do not have the resources to go back and sort the

records again. | can provide the records that have been pulled as originally requested — The amount due for the 579
records pulled is $144.75 (.25 per page).

To make Payment via credit card — Please call 1-801-254-3742 and one of our Communication Agents can process the
payment. If you choose to pay by check make the check payable to — South Jordan City and mail to:

South Jordan City

Attn: City Recorder

1600 W. Towne Center Drive

South Jordan, Utah 84095

Once payment has been received, | will mail a USB drive containing all 579 records.

Thank You,

Anna M West



Anna M West | City Recorder | City of South Jordan
1600 W. Towne Center Drive | South Jordan, UT 84095
0:801.254.3742| F: 801.254.3393
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From: Esther Kacmar [mailto:ekacmar@ebiconsulting.com]
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2017 7:29 AM

To: Anna West

Subject: RE: GRAMA Record Request dated 6/27/2017

Hello Ms. West,

I've spoken to Michael and he says out of all of those, we just need:
1) permits for the building shells

2) CofO for builidng shells

3) current building and fire inspections

Would that reduce the number of files? Please let us know.
Thank you.

Sincerely,

Esther Kacmar

RE Research Associate

21 B Street | Burlington, MA | 01803

ekacmar@ebiconsulting.com
Visit our website: www.ebiconsulting.com

Please consider the environment before printing this email

----- Original Message-----

From: Anna West [mailto:A West(@sic.utah.gov]

Sent: Wednesday, July 12,2017 5:22 PM

To: RE Research Group <reresearchgroup@ebiconsulting.com>
Subject: GRAMA Record Request dated 6/27/2017

Importance: High

Attn: Michael Monis

I am responding to your GRAMA Record Request dated 6/27/2017 requesting vatious records numbered 1-12.1
have drafted a response that basically says we have 579 records that were sent to me in response to your
request. Please see attached Response record dated 7-12-2017.



I need to know how you would like to receive copies of these 579 records. Please respond back to me asap so
that I know what our next step is with your request.

Thanks,
Anna West

Anna M West | City Recorder | City of South Jordan
1600 W. Towne Center Drive | South Jordan, UT 84095
0: 801.254.3742| F: 801.254.3393
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Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the recipient and
others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or
taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

This email has been scanned for viruses and malware, and may have been automatically archived by Mimecast Ltd, an innovator in
Software as a Service (SaaS) for business. Providing a safer and mare useful place for your human generated data. Specializing in;
Security, archiving and compliance. To find out more Click Here.



